Government of Andhra Pradesh

Forest Department

Result of e Tender cum e Auction of Red Sanders Wood conducted on 21.12.2016

Grade | LotNo. | Weightin MT Highest(lIBJi;lDl;eceived Confirmation Status
A TPT-el0 27.54 56100 Accepted and Confirmed
A TPT-e47 28.77 58800 Accepted and Confirmed
A TPT-e48 26.94 54500 Accepted and Confirmed
A TPT-e49 29.96 0 No Bid
A TPT-e59 14.06 61100 Accepted and Confirmed
A TPT-e60 27.96 62500 Accepted and Confirmed
A TPT-e9 17.55 0 No Bid
B KDP-e64 22.56 0 No Bid
B KDP-e65 20.19 0 No Bid
B KDP-e66 25.21 0 No Bid
B R]JPT-e46 12.45 0 No Bid
B TPT-el1 23.61 0 No Bid
B TPT-el2 21.99 0 No Bid
B TPT-e13 23.39 0 No Bid
B TPT-e14 22.99 0 No Bid
B TPT-e50 26.30 0 No Bid
B TPT-e51 23.57 0 No Bid
B TPT-e52 25.10 48100 Accepted and Confirmed
B TPT-e53 22.65 0 No Bid
B TPT-e54 22.74 47600 Accepted and Confirmed
B TPT-e55 23.41 0 No Bid
B TPT-e56 22.40 0 No Bid
B TPT-e57 24.14 0 No Bid
B TPT-e58 23.51 40900 Accepted and Confirmed
B TPT-e7 6.63 0 No Bid
C KDP-e68 40.47 0 No Bid
C KDP-e69 41.77 0 No Bid
C PDT-e74 49.29 0 No Bid
C PDT-e75 47.16 0 No Bid
C PDT-e77 39.90 0 No Bid
C R]JPT-e44 41.42 0 No Bid
C RJPT-e45 33.02 0 No Bid
C TPT-e6 45.26 0 No Bid
C TPT-e8 21.02 0 No Bid

Sd. R.G. Kalaghatgi
Prl Chief Conservator of Forests (HoFF)




